

PUBLIC AUCTION 1762-PA RESULTS
MAY 1, 2015

Auction #			PRO					
Bidder #	PID	ADDRESS	TYPE	ERNEST	MIN BID	SALE PRICE	OC Sale	
1	200	18 027 24 31 0010	4709 98th St W, Bloomington	R	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 153,300.00	\$157,500.00	
2	208	03 118 22 21 0046	6080 Annapolis La N, Plymouth	R	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 300,000.00	\$342,500.00	
3	203	30 120 21 43 0031	50 Address Unassigned, Champli	LC	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 502,400.00	\$502,400.00	
4	NB	05 118 21 31 0117	5728 Oregon Ct N, Crystal	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 60,400.00	No Bid	
5	200	11 118 21 12 0136	5111 Logan Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$85,000.00	
6	NB	12 118 21 43 0014	4631 Lyndale Ave N	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 45,800.00	No Bid	
7	---	19 028 23 11 0163	5549 43rd Ave S	R	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 5,200.00	Withdrawn	
8	NB	02 028 24 14 0208	3208 17th Ave S	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 41,200.00	No Bid	
9	104	03 028 24 13 0118	3309 1st Ave S	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 32,500.00	\$105,000.00	
10	NB	03 028 24 14 0066	3243 3rd Ave S	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 27,600.00	No Bid	
11	NB	03 028 24 14 0156	3305 3rd Ave S	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 46,200.00	No Bid	
12	3	10 028 24 11 0141	3812 4th Ave S	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 8,800.00	\$20,000.00	
13	205	24 028 24 13 0082	5617 25th Ave S	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 52,900.00	\$71,000.00	
14	200	04 029 24 14 0035	4015 Lyndale Ave N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$5,400.00	
15	127	04 029 24 43 0092	3719 Girard Ave N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 4,400.00	\$4,400.00	
16	6	04 029 24 43 0211	3600 Emerson Ave N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$4,000.00	
17	NB	04 029 24 44 0091	3722 Dupont Ave N	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 29,400.00	No Bid	
18	NB	08 029 24 12 0028	3501 Thomas Ave N	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 31,100.00	No Bid	
19	106	09 029 24 11 0068	3507 Aldrich Ave N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,600.00	Did Not Close (Delq.)	
20	200	09 029 24 12 0197	3418 Fremont Ave N	R	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 8,300.00	\$20,000.00	
21	143	09 029 24 14 0049	3331 Colfax Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 38,800.00	\$77,500.00	
22	200	09 029 24 14 0092	3314 Bryant Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$12,000.00	
23	143	09 029 24 22 0091	3459 Oliver Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 31,100.00	\$47,500.00	
24	113	09 029 24 23 0098	3301 Oliver Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 14,900.00	\$32,500.00	
25	200	10 029 24 22 0020	3500 4th St N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$5,500.00	
26	206	10 029 24 22 0087	3538 Lyndale Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 21,100.00	\$30,000.00	
27	128	10 029 24 23 0050	3315 6th St N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$5,000.00	
28	200	10 029 24 23 0170	3210 4th St N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$55,000.00	
29	127	10 029 24 23 0191	422 33rd Ave N	LR	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,300.00	Did Not Close	
30	120	16 029 24 32 0146	1626 Oliver Ave N	R	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 6,900.00	\$45,000.00	
31	113	16 029 24 34 0044	1324 Irving Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 20,200.00	\$32,500.00	
32	NB	16 029 24 34 0118	1338 Logan Ave N	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 17,600.00	No Bid	
33	112	17 029 24 11 0006	2307 West Broadway	SR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 19,800.00	\$25,000.00	
34	200	17 029 24 12 0101	2312 Upton Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 19,600.00	\$37,500.00	
35	138	17 029 24 14 0047	1921 Queen Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$25,000.00	
36	200	17 029 24 41 0056	1819 Queen Ave N	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 12,400.00	\$27,500.00	
37	NB	35 029 24 41 0110	2701 Bloomington Ave	LC	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 39,900.00	No Bid	\$39,900.00
38	NB	17 029 24 42 0039	1607 Thomas Ave N	LR	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 19,200.00	No Bid	
39	104	35 029 24 42 0130	2609 15th Ave S	R	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 17,200.00	\$67,500.00	
Total						\$1,735,800.00	\$1,842,200.00	\$39,900.00
						Total Sales:	\$1,882,100.00	