

# PUBLIC AUCTION PROPERTY LIST MAY 2, 2014 RESULTS

Bidder #					PRO				Auction/
Purchased	SALE PRICE	PID	ADDRESS	MUNI	TYPE	ERNEST	MIN BID	Counter	
1	\$115,000.00	05-117-21-31-0012	7312 14TH ST W,	ST. LOUIS P	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 36,500.00	Auction	
2	\$67,500.00	01-118-21-34-0109	5438 DUPONT AVE N,	BRKLYN CTR	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 53,400.00	Auction	
3	\$48,000.00	28-119-21-43-0098	5318 70TH CIRCLE N,	BRKLYN CTR	Y	\$10,000.00	\$ 30,600.00	Auction	
4	\$80,000.00	10-118-21-43-0004	4633 EWING AVE N,	ROBBINSDALE	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 72,900.00	Auction	
5	\$46,900.00	16-118-21-23-0003	4209 ZANE AVE N,	ROBBINSDALE	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 46,900.00	Auction	
6	\$208,000.00	09-119-21-12-0005	00048 UNASSIGNED	BRKLYN PK	LC	\$25,000.00	\$ 201,600.00	Auction	
7	\$226,500.00	09-119-21-21-0005	00048 UNASSIGNED	BRKLYN PK	LC	\$25,000.00	\$ 226,500.00	Auction	
8	\$300,400.00	09-119-21-21-0007	00048 UNASSIGNED	BRKLYN PK	LC	\$25,000.00	\$ 300,400.00	Auction	
9	\$78,500.00	34-119-22-21-0007	13846 69TH AVE N,	MPL GROVE	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 75,500.00	Auction	
10	\$16,000.00	19-029-24-13-0006	0028 ADDRESS UNASSIGNED	GLDN VAL	LI	\$1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	Auction	
11	\$175,000.00	19-029-24-13-0016	4696 OLSON MEMORIAL HWY	GLDN VAL	I	\$1,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	Auction	
12	\$58,000.00	06-028-23-33-0125	3744 SNELLING AVE	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 21,100.00	Auction	
13		01-028-24-12-0053	3122 MINNEHAHA AVE	MPLS	LR	\$10,000.00	\$ 19,100.00	No Bid	
14	\$95,000.00	01-028-24-33-0064	3622 LONGFELLOW AVE	MPLS	DB	\$10,000.00	\$ 25,600.00	Auction	
15	\$88,000.00	03-028-24-21-0114	3136 PILLSBURY AVE	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 17,400.00	Auction	
16	\$ 105,000.00	26-029-24-32-0167	614 15th STREET E	MPLS	C	\$10,000.00	\$ 37,900.00	Auction	
17	CPED purchase	<del>02-028-24-32-0132</del>	<del>3545 COLUMBUS AVE S</del>	MPLS	LR	<del>\$10,000.00</del>	<del>\$ 23,300.00</del>	No Bid	
18	\$91,000.00	03-028-24-44-0129	3716 5TH AVE S	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 25,900.00	Auction	
19	\$140,000.00	36-029-24-41-0058	2619 28TH AVE S	MPLS	C	\$10,000.00	\$ 90,000.00	Auction	
20	\$60,000.00	01-029-24-32-0111	3114 TYLER ST N E	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 50,600.00	Auction	
21	\$12,300.00	04-029-24-14-0136	4018 COLFAX AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$10,000.00	\$ 12,300.00	Auction	
22	\$50,000.00	04-029-24-41-0122	3841 ALDRICH AVE N	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 25,300.00	Auction	
23	\$57,000.00	08 029 24 43 0013	2611 THOMAS AVE N	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 10,200.00	Auction	
24	\$2,000.00	09-029-24-14-0064	3301 COLFAX AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	Auction	
25		09-029-24-31-0026	3107 HUMBOLDT AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$10,000.00	\$ 20,900.00	No Bid	
26	\$42,000.00	10-029-24-24-0021	3302 WASHINGTON AVE N	MPLS	R	\$1,000.00	\$ 7,900.00	Auction	
27	\$25,000.00	15-029-24-22-0066	2231 3RD ST N	MPLS	R	\$1,000.00	\$ 2,500.00	Auction	
28		15-029-24-22-0100	318 25TH AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$10,000.00	\$ 25,300.00	No Bid	
29	\$1,800.00	15-029-24-22-0101	314 25TH AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$1,000.00	\$ 1,800.00	OTC	
30	\$750.00	16-029-24-12-0123	1216 25TH AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$1,000.00	\$ 500.00	Auction	
31	\$16,000.00	16-029-24-33-0106	1912 15TH AVE N	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 11,200.00	Auction	
32	\$30,000.00	17-029-24-14-0221	2130 QUEEN AVE N	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 20,200.00	Auction	
33		21-029-24-21-0005	1210 IRVING AVE N	MPLS	LR	\$10,000.00	\$ 16,800.00	No Bid	
34	\$32,500.00	21 029 24 23 0061	710 OLIVER AVE N	MPLS	R	\$10,000.00	\$ 21,100.00	Auction	
35	\$17,900.00	21-029-24-32-0214	2014 GLENWOOD AVE N	MPLS	DB	\$10,000.00	\$ 17,900.00	Auction	
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$2,286,050.00</b>						\$1,499,900.00		