

**RESULTS FOR HENNEPIN COUNTY TAX FORFEITED LAND PUBLIC AUCTION
1946-PA NOVEMBER 3, 2017**

#	Address	PID	CITY	Type	Land Use	Minimum Bid	Sold Amount
1	5703 100th Ave N	09-119-21-21-0097	BROOKLYN PARK	LC	Land Commercial	\$ 150,000.00	No Bid
2	50 Address Unassigned	30-120-21-13-0005	CHAMPLIN	LC	Land Commercial	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid
3	5203 Angeline Ave N	09-118-21-12-0173	CRYSTAL	R	TOWNHOME	\$ 60,000.00	No Bid
4	7489 Inland Lane N	29-119-22-23-0022	MAPLE GROVE	R	Single Family Home	\$ 275,000.00	\$ 360,000.00
5	2925 36th Ave S	31-029-23-34-0078	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 97,500.00
6	4327 Humboldt Ave N	04-029-24-21-0107	MINNEAPOLIS	R	Single Family Home	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 57,500.00
7	3642 Fremont Ave N	04-029-24-43-0191	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 8,000.00	No Bid
8	3839 Penn Ave N	05-029-24-41-0186	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 18,000.00	No Bid
9	3006 Russell Ave N	08-029-24-41-0132	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00
10	2722 Newton Ave N	09-029-24-33-0081	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 16,700.00	No Bid
11	2635 Oliver Ave N	09-029-24-33-0116	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 9,500.00	No Bid
12	2819 James Ave N	09-029-24-34-0090	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 5,500.00
13	2935 Lyndale Ave N	09-029-24-41-0007	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 5,500.00
14	2922 Aldrich Ave N	09-029-24-41-0019	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 18,000.00	No Bid
15	2915 Colfax Ave N	09-029-24-41-0099	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
16	2515 3rd St N	15-029-24-22-0092	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 12,300.00	No Bid
17	317 26th Ave N	15-029-24-22-0108	MINNEAPOLIS	R	Single Family Home	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 47,500.00
18	2511 4th St N	15-029-24-22-0118	MINNEAPOLIS	R	Single Family Home	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 25,000.00
19	1712 Hillside	16-029-24-21-0200	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 9,800.00	No Bid
20	1410 15th Ave N	16-029-24-34-0023	MINNEAPOLIS	R	Single Family Home	\$ 29,600.00	No Bid
21	1338 Logan Ave N	16-029-24-34-0118	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 15,600.00	No Bid
22	1423 Girard Ave N	16-029-24-43-0028	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 29,400.00	No Bid
23	1639 Washburn Ave N	17-029-24-42-0139	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 6,100.00	\$ 8,500.00
24	1012 Logan Ave N	21-029-24-21-0122	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 36,000.00	No Bid
25	625 Elwood Ave N	21-029-24-24-0112	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 12,500.00
26	247 Girard Ave N	21-029-24-43-0045	MINNEAPOLIS	LR	Land Residential	\$ 10,200.00	\$ 32,000.00
							\$ 665,000.00

**Any parcels for which no bid is received during the public sale may be rebid for purchase beginning the next business day, Monday, November 6, 2017 at 9:00 a.m. at the office of Resident and Real Estate Services; Hennepin County Government Center A600 for not less than the Minimum Bid price set forth on List 1946-PA.